6/17/2019

BID TABULATION
BID 16-16 UNLEADED GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

CITY OF WICHITA FALLS

MARK-UP MARK-UP
MARK-UP DIESEL TOTAL DIESEL TOTAL TOTAL
BIDDER UNLEADED TOTAL CENTRAL DIESEL | LANDFILL DIESEL DEALER
(400,000 GAL) | UNLEADED | (550,000 GAL) | CENTRAL | (200,000 GAL) | LANDFILL | MARKUP
BMH OIL COMPANY $ 0.0200 | $ 8000 |$ 00200|$ 11,000|$ 0.0200|$  2,000]$% 21,000
WICHITA FALLS TX
HAIGOOD & CAMPBELL | $ 0.0150 | $ 6,000 |$ 00150|$ 8250|$ 00350|%$  3,5500]|$% 17,750
ARCHER CITY TX
PETROLEUM TRADERS | $ 1.6600 | $ 664,000 |$  1.2000 |$ 660,000 |$  4.9900 [ $ 499,000 |$ 1,823,000
FORT WAYNE IN
THE BARGAIN SOURCE | $ 0.0590 [$ 23600|$ 00690 |$ 37950 |$ 02237 |$ 22370 |$% 83,920

GARLAND TX

NOTE: This bid tabulation has been calculated unsing the City's estimated usage for the last 12 months.

WICHITA COUNTY

BURKBURNETT IOWA PARK ELECTRA

2 TANKS / 3 COMPARTMENTS 2 TANKS 3 TANKS

BIDDER UNLEADED DIESEL UNLEADED | DIESEL UNLEADED | DIESEL
(5,000 GAL) | (10,000 GAL) | (8,000 GAL) | (9,000 GAL) | (1,000GAL) | (2,000 GAL)

BMH OIL COMPANY NO BID $ 0.05($ 0.05 NO BID
WICHITA FALLS TX
HAIGOOD & CAMPBELL $ 017 | $ 017 | $ 015 % 0151 $% 02519% 0.25
WICHITA FALLS TX
PETROLEUM TRADERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
FORT WAYNE IN
THE BARGAIN SOURCE [ $ 0.0950 | $ 0.0950 | $ 0.0772 | $ 0.0772 | $ 03219% 0.32
GARLAND TX




